- ,; GOVERNMENT OF ODISHA
FINANCE DEPARTMENT

Fhnkk

NOTIFICATION
23
No.FIN-CS3-RULE-0002-2022/ O0YU /F;  Date: 52‘1#’ fFebruary 20

In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to Article 309 of the
Constitution of India, the Governor of Odisha is pleased to make the following rules,
further to amend the Odisha Civil Services (Pension) Rules, 1992, namely:-

1. (1) These rules may be called the Odisha Civil Services (Pension)
Amendment Rules, 2023.

(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Odisha
Gazette.

2. In the Odisha Civil Services (Pension) Rules, 1992, (hereinafter referred to
as the said rules), in rule (2), in sub-rule (1), in clause (b), after sub-clause (iii), the
following sub-clause shall be inserted namely:-

(iv) in case of a transgender child, if lives single, of a Government Servant or
retired Government Servant who died on or after 10th January 2020 shall be treated as
an unmarried daughter in case there is no other elder unmarried daughter/ disabled
unmarried daughter subject to other conditions as mentioned in sub-clause(iii) above.

Provided that, the Child above twenty-five years in age must be wholly
dependent on Government Servant/ Retired Government Servant for consideration of
grant of family pension.

3. In the said rules, in rule 56, in sub-rule (5),-

(i). in clause (d) for the words “Four Thousand Four Hundred and Forty” the
words “Ten Thousand” shall be substituted; and

(ii). in clause (f) in sub-clause (iv) for the words “Four Thousand Four
Hundred Forty” the words “Ten Thousand” shall be substituted.

By order of/ the Governor

r—

Principal Secretary to Government



2

Memo No. 60‘_'[5 /F Date: 24Y.02.7202%

Copy forwarded to All Departments of Government/All Heads of Departments
/ All Collectors / All District and Sessions Judges / Deputy Accountant General,
Odisha, Puri / Secretary to Governor / Principal Secretary to Chief Minister/ Secretary
to Odisha Legislative Assembly / Principal, Secretariat Training Institute,
Bhubaneswar / Director General, Gopabandhu Academy of Administration,
Bhubaneswar / Director, Madhusudan Das Regional Academy of Financial
Management, Bhubaneswar / Manager, Reserve Bank of India, Public Accounts

Department, Bhubaneswar for information. N> 2
(Mk"ﬁ/av\\ﬂ :

Joint Secretary to Government

Memo No. (50‘15 /F Date: 2(.02.- 223

Copy forwarded to the Principal Accountant General (A&E), Odisha,
Bhubaneswar for information and immediate necessary action. &
@,ﬂh Ak

Joint Secretary to Government
Memo No. 60(‘{ ? /F Date: 2Y-02. 2023

Copy forwarded to All Treasury Officers of District Treasuries and Special
Treasuries / Sub-Treasuries for information and immediate necessary acﬁ‘wlg
Y

Joint Secretary to ove?'\n ent
Memo No. 60#? /F Date: Qy.02.2027

Copy forwarded to the Regional Manager, Central Bank of India, 94, J anpath,
Unit-III, Bhubaneswar Zonal Office, Andhra Bank, Zonal Office, M-14, Baramunda,
Bhubaneswar / Zonal Manager, Bank of India, Bhubaneswar Zone, STAR HOUSE,
I/ID, Jayadev Vihar, Nayapalli, Bhubaneswar Regional Manager, Union Bank of
India, regional Office, 3/1A, Civic Centre, IRC Village, Nayapalli, Bhubaneswar/
Regional Manager, Allahabad Bank, Zonal Office, 3/IB/ Civic Centre, IRC Village,
Nayapalli, Bhubaneswar/ Indian Overseas Bank, Regional Office, B/2, West
Saheednagar, BBSR -751007, Bhubaneswar /Circle Office, Indian Bank, B/2
Saheeddnagar (East), Bhubaneswar/ Regional Manager, regional Office, United Bank
of India, 88-A, Kalpana Area, Bhubaneswar/ Zonal Manager, UCO Bank, UCO Bank
Building, C-2 Ashok Nagar, Bhubaneswar / Circle Office, Punjab National Bank, 4th
Floor, Deendayal Bhawan, Ashok Nagar, Janapath, Bhubaneswar/ Circle Office,
Canara Bank, Circle Office, 1st Floor, Red Cross Bhavan, Sachivalaya Marg, Unix-
IX, Bhubaneswar / Local Head Office, State Bank of India, I1I/1, Pt. Jawaharlal Nehru
Marg, Bhubaneswar / Regional Manager, Bank of Baroda, Plot No- 171, Bhouma
Nagar, Unit-IV, Bhubaneswar for information and immediate necessary action. 7A7:9

Joint Secretfl? to Government



Memo No. 6099 /F Date: 2Y.02: 2023

Copy forwarded to Accountant General (A&E) of State Governments /Union
Territories in India (as listed below). Andhra Pradesh, Hyderabad / Bihar, Patna /
Madhya Pradesh, Gawalior (2copies) / Maharashtra, Mumbai (2 copies) /
Maharashtra, Nagpur-440001 / Uttar Pradesh, Allahabad (2 copies) / West Bengal,
Kolkata (2 copies) / Gujarat, Ahamedabad / Tamilnadu, Chennai / Karnataka,
Bangalore / Rajasthan, Jeypur / Assam, Guwahati / Kerala, Thiruananthapuram /
Punjab, Chandigarh / Haryana, Chandigarh / Himachal Pradesh, Simla / Jammu &
Kashmir, Srinagar/ Arunachal Pradesh, Itanagar / Manipur, Imphal / Tripura, Agartala
/ Meghalaya, Shillong / Nagaland, Kohima / Jharkhand, Ranchi / Chattishgarh, Raipur
/ Uttaranchal, Dehradun / Pay and Accounts Officers, Tis Hazari, Delhi / Controller
of Accounts, Delhi for information and immediate necessary action. He is requested to
circulate this Resolution among the pension paying public sector banks functioning
within the jurisdiction of the concerned State for prompt payment to the Odisha State

Pensioners.
: +%
o fdl
Joint Secrétary to Government
Memo No. &050 /F Date: 24.02- 2023

Copy forwarded to the Deputy Secretary to Government of India, Ministry of
Personnel, P.G. and Pension, Department of Pension and Pensioners Welfare, New
Delhi / Deputy Chief Accountant, Reserve Bank of India, Department of Government
and Bank Accounts, Central Office, 4th Floor, Byculla Office Building, Opposite
Mumbai Central Station Byculla, Mumbai 400008 for information and necessary

action. ‘& W 2%

Joint Secretary to Government
Memo No. 605} /F Date: 2(4-.02- 202%

Copy forwarded to the Secretaries to Finance Department in all State
Government / Union Territories in India with a request to circulate this Office
Memorandum among the Pension Disbursing Authorities functioning within the
jurisdiction of the concerned State for prompt payment to the Odisha State Pensioners.

Joint Secretary to Government



4

Memo No. ﬂ/}? Date: AU 02 2023

Copy forwarded to the Director, Printing, Stationery and Publication, Odisha,
Cuttack with a request to publish the Notification in the next issue of Odisha Gazette
and supply 100( one hundred) printed copies to the Finance Department. The
Notification is statutory and will bear S.R.O number.

o\‘\“ e

1

A )

Joint Secretary to Government

Memo No. 6053 /F Date: 2Y:02. 2025

Copy forwarded to all Officers and all Branches of Finance Department /
Deputy Examiner, Local Fund Audit, Finance Department / Efficiency Audit
Organisation, Finance Department for information. ‘J\.Wg

el o

Joint Secretary to Government
Memo No. 605"/ /F Date: 2Y.-02- 2023

Copy forwarded to the Head of Portal Group, 1.T. Centre, Secretariat, Odisha
for information and necessary action.

He/ She is requested to launch this Notification regarding amendment of the
OCS (Pension) Rules, 1992 in the Official =~ Website
(www.Odisha.gov.nic.in/finance/index.htm) of Finance Departmenf for general

Information. Q\: = ’y{?/;

Joint Secretary to Government



